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D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N Puan Puan Puan Puan Sıra Sıra Sıra Sıra
1 0 - TOFAN SEZGİN 0 / A 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 27 3 26.25 38 2 37.50 65.00 5.00 63.75 29 11 26.25 16 4 15.00 31 4 30.00 15 5 13.75 91.00 24.00 85.00 390.469 407.368 296.513 216.188 108 1 1 1
2 0 - AHMET AGA 0 / 0 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 27 5 25.75 35 5 33.75 62.00 10.00 59.50 25 14 21.50 13 7 11.25 28 3 27.25 16 4 15.00 82.00 28.00 75.00 359.844 382.082 282.733 203.938 218 2 2 2
3 0 - EREN KADEM 0 / 0 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 31 5 29.75 30 9 27.75 61.00 14.00 57.50 26 14 22.50 13 7 11.25 30 4 29.00 15 5 13.75 84.00 30.00 76.50 364.375 378.397 296.785 205.750 241 3 3 3
4 0 - ÖZTÜRK HAN 0 / 0 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 27 7 25.25 30 10 27.50 57.00 17.00 52.75 30 9 27.75 14 6 12.50 31 4 30.00 16 4 15.00 91.00 23.00 85.25 391.719 375.064 293.953 216.688 268 4 4 4
5 0 - MERT YÜCEL ÇAKIR 0 / 0 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 26 12 23.00 29 10 26.50 55.00 22.00 49.50 31 9 28.75 16 4 15.00 35 2 34.50 14 5 12.75 96.00 20.00 91.00 409.094 372.093 294.018 223.638 288 5 5 5
6 0 - GAMZE AYŞE MUTLU 0 / 0 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 32 3 31.25 24 7 22.25 56.00 10.00 53.50 26 14 22.50 13 5 11.75 32 3 31.25 14 4 13.00 85.00 26.00 78.50 370.469 369.528 303.813 208.188 311 6 6 6
7 0 - M FURKAN ÖNEN 0 / 0 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 22 5 20.75 32 7 30.25 54.00 12.00 51.00 32 7 30.25 15 4 14.00 23 3 22.25 14 4 13.00 84.00 18.00 79.50 373.312 362.590 272.820 209.325 350 7 7 7
8 0 - TUĞBA ŞAHİN 0 / 0 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 22 6 20.50 28 7 26.25 50.00 13.00 46.75 30 10 27.50 15 4 14.00 22 5 20.75 16 2 15.50 83.00 21.00 77.75 368.156 349.066 269.992 207.262 459 8 8 8
9 0 - DUHANUR HAYTA 0 / 0 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 23 2 22.50 23 6 21.50 46.00 8.00 44.00 27 10 24.50 13 3 12.25 23 4 22.00 13 4 12.00 76.00 21.00 70.75 346.062 330.446 267.275 198.425 630 9 9 9
10 0 - ZEHRA TAŞ 0 / 0 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 20 4 19.00 21 12 18.00 41.00 16.00 37.00 32 8 30.00 14 6 12.50 25 2 24.50 11 7 9.25 82.00 23.00 76.25 362.875 317.131 263.290 205.150 763 10 10 10
11 0 - GAMZE SİNİCİ 0 / 0 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 31 5 29.75 33 6 31.50 64.00 11.00 61.25 - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 180 315.922 223.035 132.000 774 11 11 11
12 0 - HARUN YILDIZ 0 / 0 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 30 2 29.50 10 2 9.50 40.00 4.00 39.00 25 15 21.25 10 10 7.50 32 2 31.50 9 8 7.00 76.00 35.00 67.25 335.094 310.014 284.308 194.038 852 12 12 12
13 0 - DENİZ ILGIN 0 / 0 28 11 25.25 0 0 0.00 34 4 33.00 0 0 0.00 62.00 15.00 58.25 27 13 23.75 14 5 12.75 31 2 30.50 10 7 8.25 82.00 27.00 75.25 359.594 303.321 376.908 279.198 940 13 13 13
14 0 - HAYRUNİSA 0 / 0 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 18 10 15.50 25 13 21.75 43.00 23.00 37.25 26 10 23.50 14 6 12.50 23 2 22.50 9 9 6.75 72.00 27.00 65.25 328.188 302.581 238.705 191.275 949 14 14 14
15 0 - MERT PERÇİN 0 / 0 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 20 6 18.50 19 10 16.50 39.00 16.00 35.00 25 14 21.50 13 5 11.75 20 10 17.50 11 1 10.75 69.00 30.00 61.50 317.062 292.751 243.435 186.825 1061 15 15 15
16 0 - TUBALKAN 0 / A 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 16 3 15.25 16 5 14.75 32.00 8.00 30.00 30 9 27.75 12 4 11.00 13 1 12.75 14 3 13.25 69.00 17.00 64.75 327.625 280.908 237.715 191.050 1221 16 16 16
17 0 - HÜMEYRA PALA 0 / 0 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 17 4 16.00 19 9 16.75 36.00 13.00 32.75 24 9 21.75 10 6 8.50 20 3 19.25 7 8 5.00 61.00 26.00 54.50 294.875 276.726 226.910 177.950 1280 17 17 17
18 0 - İBRAHİM ÖTOĞLU 0 / E 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 15 1 14.75 19 10 16.50 34.00 11.00 31.25 23 16 19.00 10 10 7.50 14 1 13.75 12 7 10.25 59.00 34.00 50.50 283.156 266.675 218.397 173.262 1417 18 18 18
19 0 - AKSU 0 / 0 11 9 8.75 0 0 0.00 13 6 11.50 17 8 15.00 41.00 23.00 35.25 26 14 22.50 15 5 13.75 12 4 11.00 5 5 3.75 58.00 28.00 51.00 283.125 252.953 232.590 199.650 1606 19 19 19
20 0 - AHMET KARSANBA 0 / A 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 25 9 22.75 20 16 16.00 45.00 25.00 38.75 - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 180 248.883 201.615 132.000 1681 20 20 20
21 0 - NİL SAHRA 0 / 0 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 13 5 11.75 14 5 12.75 27.00 10.00 24.50 22 15 18.25 10 8 8.00 20 5 18.75 8 8 6.00 60.00 36.00 51.00 284.125 247.762 209.605 173.650 1706 21 21 21
22 0 - BEYZA 0 / 0 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 13 6 11.50 15 10 12.50 28.00 16.00 24.00 19 13 15.75 13 2 12.50 16 2 15.50 7 6 5.50 55.00 23.00 49.25 278.031 244.184 206.402 171.212 1775 22 22 22
23 0 - DAMLANUR MACİT 0 / 0 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 18 9 15.75 23 10 20.50 41.00 19.00 36.25 - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 180 241.107 180.195 132.000 1837 23 23 23
24 0 - İKLİM 0 / 0 0 1 -0.25 0 0 0.00 20 8 18.00 18 7 16.25 38.00 16.00 34.00 - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 180 235.523 186.480 131.328 1924 24 24 24
25 0 - PELİN GÖCMEN 0 / 0 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 15 6 13.50 24 12 21.00 39.00 18.00 34.50 27 13 23.75 14 6 12.50 16 4 15.00 13 4 12.00 70.00 27.00 63.25 322.594 235.225 173.310 132.000 1932 25 25 25
26 0 - HAZAL GÜLŞEN GÜL 0 / 0 33 6 31.50 0 0 0.00 19 6 17.50 0 0 0.00 52.00 12.00 49.00 28 10 25.50 14 5 12.75 13 5 11.75 5 2 4.50 60.00 22.00 54.50 294.281 230.469 325.327 272.992 2021 26 26 26
27 0 - DORİ 0 / 0 27 5 25.75 0 0 0.00 10 5 8.75 0 0 0.00 37.00 10.00 34.50 28 8 26.00 15 2 14.50 22 2 21.50 1 0 1.00 66.00 12.00 63.00 320.188 214.453 290.165 266.459 2294 27 27 27
28 0 - EBRU ALİCAN 0 / 0 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 10 6 8.50 11 15 7.25 21.00 21.00 15.75 24 12 21.00 6 5 4.75 15 1 14.75 6 5 4.75 51.00 23.00 45.25 266.406 213.840 192.572 166.562 2315 28 28 28
29 0 - YAVUZ SULTANSELİM 0 / 0 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 4 2 3.50 15 10 12.50 19.00 12.00 16.00 12 9 9.75 14 4 13.00 17 3 16.25 7 8 5.00 50.00 24.00 44.00 261.500 212.754 175.310 164.600 2330 29 29 29
30 0 - SONGÜL AKIN 0 / 0 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 13 13 9.75 9 9 6.75 22.00 22.00 16.50 22 16 18.00 9 7 7.25 13 12 10.00 6 11 3.25 50.00 46.00 38.50 244.812 206.861 187.760 157.925 2432 30 30 30
31 0 - TUĞÇE 0 / 0 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 7 6 5.50 14 15 10.25 21.00 21.00 15.75 22 18 17.50 5 12 2.00 9 9 6.75 10 10 7.50 46.00 49.00 33.75 231.156 200.238 169.292 152.462 2573 31 31 31
32 0 - ASLI BÖLÜKBAŞI 0 / 0 30 5 28.75 0 0 0.00 8 6 6.50 0 0 0.00 38.00 11.00 35.25 22 16 18.00 17 2 16.50 16 2 15.50 5 6 3.50 60.00 26.00 53.50 290.562 195.820 282.260 263.729 2679 32 32 32
33 0 - BEY* 0 / 0 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 7 13 3.75 17 14 13.50 24.00 27.00 17.25 - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 180 183.855 143.475 132.000 2931 33 33 33
34 0 - BRK 0 / 0 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 5 7 3.25 14 10 11.50 19.00 17.00 14.75 - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 180 176.708 141.945 132.000 3132 34 34 34
35 0 - MERVE A 0 / 0 29 9 26.75 24 12 21.00 4 9 1.75 0 0 0.00 57.00 30.00 49.50 29 11 26.25 15 5 13.75 9 5 7.75 2 3 1.25 55.00 24.00 49.00 276.562 175.900 256.485 316.785 3157 35 35 35
36 0 - DİLAN 0 / 0 32 6 30.50 26 7 24.25 3 2 2.50 0 0 0.00 61.00 15.00 57.25 25 13 21.75 15 5 13.75 8 2 7.50 2 0 2.00 50.00 20.00 45.00 264.156 173.199 262.952 330.974 3248 36 36 36
37 0 - SERAP ASLAN 0 / 0 25 12 22.00 26 11 23.25 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 51.00 23.00 45.25 34 6 32.50 16 4 15.00 2 1 1.75 1 0 1.00 53.00 11.00 50.25 280.281 172.112 237.392 311.744 3283 37 37 37
38 408 - BURCU ESER 0 / 0 23 9 20.75 0 0 0.00 6 6 4.50 12 13 8.75 41.00 28.00 34.00 - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 180 171.767 207.015 194.160 3294 38 38 38
39 0 - EGEMEN ARABACI 0 / 0 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 0 2 -0.50 5 7 3.25 5.00 9.00 2.75 17 13 13.75 11 8 9.00 7 1 6.75 8 5 6.75 43.00 27.00 36.25 238.000 163.748 153.670 155.200 3546 39 39 39
40 0 - SUDE BÜYÜKBAŞ 0 / 0 29 10 26.50 0 0 0.00 11 5 9.75 0 0 0.00 40.00 15.00 36.25 - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 180 161.393 241.050 211.920 3606 40 40 40
41 0 - Ç 0 / 0 26 11 23.25 0 0 0.00 11 5 9.75 0 0 0.00 37.00 16.00 33.00 - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 180 161.393 230.115 202.272 3606 40 40 40
42 0 - OKCAN DERE 0 / 0 25 9 22.75 0 0 0.00 11 6 9.50 0 0 0.00 36.00 15.00 32.25 - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 180 160.639 229.020 202.272 3633 42 42 42
43 0 - SERRA 0 / 0 11 12 8.00 15 8 13.00 4 3 3.25 2 4 1.00 32.00 27.00 25.25 15 9 12.75 8 10 5.50 8 1 7.75 3 5 1.75 34.00 25.00 27.75 211.250 157.372 177.455 209.156 3762 43 43 43
44 0 - EKİN KOTANOĞLU 0 / 0 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 5 11 2.25 5 19 0.25 10.00 30.00 2.50 16 19 11.25 10 7 8.25 7 2 6.50 4 5 2.75 37.00 33.00 28.75 214.156 153.468 152.547 145.662 3904 44 44 44
45 0 - OSMAN BALLI 0 / 0 20 6 18.50 22 4 21.00 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 42.00 10.00 39.50 20 5 18.75 13 2 12.50 2 0 2.00 2 1 1.75 37.00 8.00 35.00 233.031 153.212 205.742 275.036 3910 45 45 45
46 0 - ŞULENUR ÖZDEMİR 0 / 0 33 7 31.25 7 10 4.50 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 40.00 17.00 35.75 26 14 22.50 7 7 5.25 2 1 1.75 1 0 1.00 36.00 22.00 30.50 219.781 147.912 240.012 253.992 4116 46 46 46
47 0 - ETA 0 / 0 26 10 23.50 0 0 0.00 6 3 5.25 0 0 0.00 32.00 13.00 28.75 - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 180 147.827 216.000 203.760 4121 47 47 47
48 0 - SAMET AKIN 0 / 0 12 9 9.75 13 6 11.50 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 25.00 15.00 21.25 24 12 21.00 8 9 5.75 2 1 1.75 1 0 1.00 35.00 22.00 29.50 216.594 146.638 173.788 210.526 4163 48 48 48
49 0 - B Ö 0 / B 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 4 6 2.50 3 3 2.25 7.00 9.00 4.75 - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 180 146.454 139.650 132.000 4170 49 49 49
50 0 - FURKAN ATAYAN 0 / 0 31 6 29.50 28 9 25.75 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 59.00 15.00 55.25 18 18 13.50 14 5 12.75 0 0 0.00 1 1 0.75 33.00 24.00 27.00 207.875 143.150 228.620 310.670 4324 50 50 50
51 0 - BETÜL SOLAK 0 / 0 10 8 8.00 25 9 22.75 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 35.00 17.00 30.75 17 16 13.00 11 6 9.50 4 4 3.00 1 1 0.75 33.00 27.00 26.25 205.938 142.375 165.760 237.031 4345 51 51 51
52 0 - MERVE TEKBAŞ 0 / 0 16 16 12.00 18 16 14.00 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 34.00 32.00 26.00 19 20 14.00 12 8 10.00 0 2 -0.50 1 0 1.00 32.00 30.00 24.50 200.438 140.175 175.005 219.087 4452 52 52 52
53 0 - BARTU TOSUN 0 / 0 19 13 15.75 0 0 0.00 2 2 1.50 0 0 0.00 21.00 15.00 17.25 - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 180 136.522 182.910 180.960 4628 53 53 53
54 0 - KKN 0 / E 17 20 12.00 0 0 0.00 1 2 0.50 0 0 0.00 18.00 22.00 12.50 - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 180 133.507 169.110 168.192 4829 54 54 54
55 0 - NEHİR DOĞAN 0 / 0 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 2 2 1.50 0 4 -1.00 2.00 6.00 0.50 - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 180 133.448 136.590 132.000 4859 55 55 55
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56 0 - NEGAN 0 / 0 25 4 24.00 30 5 28.75 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 55.00 9.00 52.75 - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 180 132.000 201.300 292.752 4900 56 56 56
57 0 - CANİP ÖZCAN 0 / 0 6 20 1.00 8 8 6.00 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 14.00 28.00 7.00 - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 180 132.000 134.910 153.120 4900 56 56 56
58 0 - ŞEYMANUR 0 / 0 8 17 3.75 14 14 10.50 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 22.00 31.00 14.25 - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 180 132.000 142.455 177.456 4900 56 56 56
59 0 - FADİME 0 / 0 13 11 10.25 10 11 7.25 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 23.00 22.00 17.50 - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 180 132.000 161.835 185.664 4900 56 56 56
60 0 - FURKAN 0 / 0 31 9 28.75 8 10 5.50 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 39.00 19.00 34.25 - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 180 132.000 216.450 233.760 4900 56 56 56
61 0 - YGZ 0 / 0 12 7 10.25 16 6 14.50 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 28.00 13.00 24.75 - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 180 132.000 159.360 206.304 4900 56 56 56
62 0 - FERİDE GÖÇMEN 0 / 0 11 21 5.75 11 10 8.50 0 2 -0.50 0 0 0.00 22.00 33.00 13.75 12 19 7.25 5 5 3.75 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 17.00 24.00 11.00 158.906 122.055 137.182 167.338 5357 62 62 62
63 0 - SEVDE DEĞİRMENCİ 0 / 0 11 15 7.25 8 15 4.25 0 0 0.00 0 0 0.00 19.00 30.00 11.50 8 20 3.00 6 7 4.25 0 0 0.00 1 5 -0.25 15.00 32.00 7.00 146.312 118.525 138.925 152.653 5415 63 63 63

Genel 5.74 2.85 9.84 8.90 27.32 18.49 8.86 10.95 4.39 42.70 257.864 215.995 206.504 185.722 5479
İl 8.75 4.23 10.18 9.35 32.51 18.83 9.35 10.65 4.37 43.19 259.355 218.859 216.861 199.574 63

İlçe 8.75 4.23 10.18 9.35 32.51 18.83 9.35 10.65 4.37 43.19 259.355 218.859 216.861 199.574 63
Kurum 8.75 4.23 10.18 9.35 32.51 18.83 9.35 10.65 4.37 43.19 259.355 218.859 216.861 199.574 63

AYT TYT AYT-PUAN
ORTALAMALAR KATILIMLAR


